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can be no one else
I am running form myself
..
I am comfortable inside my skin

dear my time in hell
..
I am sorry
and nothing gonna wear me thing

so
throw my your bullets
and make me a foulest
through to my way 
through to my way 
say
throw my your bullets
and make me a foolish 
we never gonna down, down

cause we got that juice
juice, juice
that’s how we do
no one hide in our skin
we so high
we don’t care about you 
got that juice
juice, juice
that’s how we do
we so high
we don’t care about you 
got that juice

we so high
we don’t care about you 
got that juice
we so high
we don’t care about you 
got that juice

you’re the voice is loud
you wanna pull the stop
let them get the best of me
the best of me is now
stage may battel ground
I know
friends are all my enemies

so
throw my your bullets
and make me a foulest
through to my way 
through to my way 
say
throw my your bullets
and make me a foolish 
we never gonna down, down

cause we got that juice
juice, juice
that’s how we do
no one hide in our skin
we so high
we don’t care about you 



got that juice
juice, juice
that’s how we do
we so high
we don’t care about you 
got that juice

we so high
we don’t care about you 
got that juice
we so high
we don’t care about you 
got that juice
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